
HOW TO CHOOSE THE
RIGHT FUND MANAGER: 

KEY DO'S AND DON'TS FOR INVESTORS



The success of your mutual fund investments often depends on the
expertise of the fund manager. Here are the essential do’s and don’ts to
help you make a smart, informed choice.

Introduction



Before investing, go beyond just performance. Understand the
manager's investment philosophy, strategy, and track record to ensure
they align with your financial goals and risk tolerance.

Do - Conduct Thorough Research



While past performance doesn’t guarantee future returns, it offers
insights into a manager’s ability to navigate market ups and downs.
Look for consistency and how they perform against benchmarks.

While past performance doesn’t guarantee future returns, it offers
insights into a manager’s ability to navigate market ups and downs.
Look for consistency and how they perform against benchmarks.

Do - Analyze Past Performance

Do - Review fund manager credentials



Fund managers typically have a specific approach, such as value or
growth investing. Make sure their strategy aligns with your financial
objectives and that they’re transparent about their methods.

Fund expenses can eat into your returns. Compare fees across
different funds, and ensure the performance justifies higher costs, or
opt for lower-cost alternatives if necessary.

Do - Understand Their Investment Approach

Do - Consider Fees & Expenses



It’s easy to get swayed by past success, but markets evolve. Always
evaluate the fund manager’s risk management practices and overall
investment philosophy alongside their historical returns.

Don’t - Solely Rely on Past Performance



High returns mean little without proper risk control. Look for managers
who prioritize balancing growth with risk, focusing on diversification and
long-term stability.

Don’t - Overlook Risk Management



A good fund manager should be open about their investment decisions
and portfolio changes. Avoid managers who are vague or evasive about
fund performance and strategy.

Don’t get caught up in hype. Fund managers with recent media buzz
may not always have long-term success. Focus on their track record
and consistency over time.

Don’t - Ignore Communication and Transparency

Don’t - Chase Hot Trends



Selecting the right fund manager is a crucial part of your investment
journey. By considering their philosophy, risk management, and fees,
and following these key do’s and don’ts, you can make more informed
decisions for your financial future.

Conclusion




